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Preface

Welcome to the 8th International Natural Language Processing and

Cognitive Science workshop, which is part of a series of workshops
previously organised in Porto (2004), Miami (2005), Paphos (2006),
Funchal (2007), Barcelona (2008), Milan (2009) and Funchal (2010).
The aim of this workshop is to bring together researchers and practi-
tioners in Natural Language Processing (NLP) working within the
paradigm of Cognitive Science. The overall emphasis of the workshop
is on the contribution of cognitive science to language processing in
such areas as conceptualisation, representation, meaning construction,
human and machine translation processes, ontology building, and text
mining. This year, NLPCS was devoted to the special theme of “Hu-
man-Machine Interaction in Translation”.

NLPCS 2011 received 29 papers from 17 countries. All contributions
were reviewed in a double-blind procedure by three members of the
programme committee. Based on these reviews, 18 contributions were
selected for presentation as full papers, covering the following topics:
cognitive processes and evaluation issues in machine translation, syn-
tactic and semantic aspects of natural language processing, sentiment
analysis, building of terminological ontologies for knowledge sharing.
In addition to the papers four invited keynote lectures by professor R.
Mahesh K. Sinha, professor V. N. Shukla, Dr. Michael Zock, and pro-
fessor Pushpak Bhattacharyya were presented. The texts received are
included in the volume.

The editors of these proceedings would like to thank the authors for
their contributions and the members of the programme committee for
their review work. Special thanks go to the local organisers, Dr. Merete
Borch, Dr. Michael Carl, and professor Arnt Lykke Jakobsen.

We look forward to seeing you at NLPCS 2012.

August 2011

The editors
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